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Clarke County
School District

Better Every Day

1. ALPS ROAD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Cherokee
Buckeye Cleaning & Southeastern

American 1st Associated | Athens Cleaning Paper Equipment & | The Haskins

Maintenance Paper Janitorial Center of ATL | Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Thornton Brothers
AUTO SCRUBBER, 207, Brush Driven
Manufacturer/Model Clarke Windsor SSS/Panther | Clarke Minuteman | Karcher BD Viper

56385415 Sabor 20 207D 56384776 E20BDQP | 50/50 AS5160 Viper S5160 Viper AS510B
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 | $4,961.84 $6,298.19 | $4,529.15 $3,293.31 $3,660.04 | $3,042.60 $2,797.00 $2,659.17 $2,719.00

$4,961.84 $6,298.19 | $4,529.15 $3.293.31 $3,660.04 | $3,042.60 $2,797.00 $2,659.17 $2,719.00

2. TIMOTHY ROAD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
Cherokee
Buckeye Cleaning & Southeastern

American 18t Associated | Athens Cleaning Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton

Maintenance Paper Janitorial Center of ATL | Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
CARPET EXTRACTOR
Manufacturer/Model Windsor Simpro Minuteman | Windsor

Viper CEX410 | Admiral 8 | SSS/Bobcat | SP1610SE X17115HP | Admiral 18 Viper CE410 | Viper CE410 Viper SL10BOX
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $1,038.67 $2,240.80 | $1,242.50 $1,170.00 $1,992.69 | $2,185.20 $1,234.00 $1,162.96 $1,221.00

$1,038.67 $2,240.80 | $1,242.50 $1,170.00 $1,992.69 | $2,185.20 $1,234.00 $1,162.96 $1,221.00

Cherokee
Buckeye Cleaning Southeastern

American 18t Associated | Athens Cleaning & Paper Equipment & The Haskins Thornton

Maintenance Paper Janitorial Center of ATL | Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
WET DRY VACCUM
Manufacturer/Model Windsor Koblenz-

Advance Recover SSS/Black AL- Windsor

56384673 18 Cat Clarke 18WD | 1660PA Recoverl8 Viper SN18WD | Viper SN18 Viper SN18
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $628.75 $734.02 $535.25 $525.48 $462.85 $693.65 $494.00 $465.06 $588.00

$628.75 $734.02 $535.25 $525.48 $462.85 $693.65 $494.00 $465.06 $588.00

V4 Better Every Day




3. OGLETHORPE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS
SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 - WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1st Associated | Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
AUTO SCRUBBER, 30”, BRUSH DRIVEN
Manufacturer/Model Windor Clarke CT
Clarke Sabor SSS/Panther | 95411A Minuteman | Karcher BD Viper Fang Minuteman, E30
054114A Cutter 32 28TD (34" E30BDQP | 80/100 32T-250 Viper Fang 28T Walk Behind
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 | $8,830.00 $9,355.63 $5,654.75 $9,759.52 $6,781.01 $6,050.00 $7,250.00 $5,249.76 $6,474.00
$8,830.00 $9,355.63 $5,654.75 $9,759.52 $6,781.01 $6.050.00 $7,250.00 $5,249.76 $6,474.00
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning Southeastern
American 1t Associated | Athens Center of & Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
BACKPACK VACUUM
Manufacturer/Model Windsor
Advance Vac Pac Pro Clarke Proteam Windor Vac Advance
Adgility 6XP Herpa 6 Team/Pro 6 | 9060610010 | 107303 Pac HEPA 6 Adgility 6XP Advance 6XP Mosquito 6 Qt
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:2 | $307.50 $384.08 $399.97 $280.30 $385.60 $374.55 $315.00 $300.29 $284.00
$615.00 $768.18 $799.94 $560.60 $771.20 $794.10 $630.00 $600.58 $568.00
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 15t Associated | Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
MICRO SCRUBBER, New Advance, SC250
(or Equal), with one 7.8 ah lithium battery,
onboard charger, medium duty white cylindrical
brush NO BID
Manufacturer/Model Advance Karcher Clarke MA30 | Minuteman | Karcher Advance
SC250 BR35/12 13B E14115 BD30/4 SC250 Advance SC250 | Advance SC250
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $1,711.25 $3,511.29 $1,851.77 $1,768.45 | $1,786.78 $1,795.00 $1,682.20 $1,996.00
$1,711.25 $3,511.29 $1,851.77 $1,768.45 | $1,786.78 $1,795.00 $1,682.20 $1,996.00

V4 Better Every Day




CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1t | Associated | Athens Center of Paper Equipment & The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
CARPET EXTRACTOR
Manufacturer/Model Viper Windsor SSS/ Simpro Minuteman | Windor
CEX410 Admiral 8 Bobcat SP1610SE | X17115HP | Admiral 8 Viper CEX410 | Viper CEX410 Viper SL10BOX
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 | $1,038.67 $2,240.88 | $1,242.50 | $1,170.00 | $1,992.69 | $2,185.20 $1,234.00 $1,162.96 $1,221.00
$1,038.67 $2,240.88 | $1,242.50 | $1,170.00 | $1,992.69 | $2,185.20 $1,234.00 $1,162.96 $1,221.00
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1t | Associated | Athens Center of Paper Equipment & The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
WET DRY VACUUM
Manufacturer/Model Advance Windsor SSS/ Clarke Koblenz Windsor Viper
56384673 Recover 18 | Black Cat | 18WD AL-1660PA | Recover 18 SN18WD Viper SN18 Viper SN18
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $628.75 $734.02 $535.25 $580.48 $462.85 $693.65 $494.00 $465.06 $588.00
$628.75 $734.02 $535.25 $580.48 $462.85 $693.65 $494.00 $465.06 $588.00
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1%t | Associated | Athens Center of Paper Equipment & The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
SWEEPER, BSW 28 Commercial Battery
Sweeper — CT56383523 /9084705010 (or Equal)
Manufacturer/Model Windsor IPC
Clarke Radius 280 | Eagle/Smart | Clarke Minuteman | Karcher
9084705010 | Deluxe Vac 664 9084705010 | KS28WQP | KM10/30 Clarke BSW28 | Clarke BSW28 IPC Eagle Smart
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 | $2,808.00 $2,094.02 $1,995.67 $2,944.44 $1,601.48 | $2,041.60 $2,697.00 $2,586.80 $1,990.00
$2,808.00 $2,094.02 $1,995.67 $2,944.44 $1,601.48 | $2,041.60 $2,697.00 $2,586.80 $1,990.00

V4 Better Every Day




4. WHITEHEAD ROAD ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye | Cherokee
Cleaning | Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1t | Associated Athens Center of | Paper Equipment & The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed,
20 Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20T- | Clarke Minuteman | Windsor Clarke
56383523 Lightning 210 56383523 | M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 Clarke 56383523
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 | $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 | $4,200.70 | $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 | $4,200.70 | $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00
5. H.T. EDWARDS BUILDING
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1t | Associated Athens Center of | Paper Equipment & The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed,
20 Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery
Charger, Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20T- | Clarke Minuteman Windsor Clarke Minuteman
56383523 Lightning 210 56383523 | M26036QP | Lightning | 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 M26036QP
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 | $4,200.70 $5,720.15 | $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 | $4,200.70 $5,720.15 | $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00

V4 Better Every Day




6. BURNEY-HARRIS-LYONS MIDDLE SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1st Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
MICRO SCRUBBER, New Advance, SC250 (or
Equal), with one 7.8 ah lithium battery, onboard
charger, medium duty white cylindrical brush NO BID
Manufacturer/Model Advance Windsor BR Clarke MA30 | Minuteman Karcher BD Advance Advance
SC250 35/12 13B E14115 30/4 SC250 SC250 Advance SC250
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $1,711.25 $3,511.29 $1,851.77 $1,768.45 $1,786.78 $1,795.00 $1,682.20 $1,996.00
$1,711.25 $3,511.29 $1,851.77 $1,768.45 $1,786.78 $1,795.00 $1,682.20 $1,996.00
7. CLARKE MIDDLE SCHOOL
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 15t | Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20T | Clarke Minute Windsor Clarke
56383523 Lightning -210 56383523 M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 | Clarke 56383523
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00

V4 Better Every Day




CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1%t Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc Company Brothers
RIDE-ON BUFFER, NSS, eForce Burnisher,
Battery Powered Ride-On Burnisher, 6402770, 6,
6V, 430AH Wet Cell Batteries, with Vac-Trac
Collection System NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer/Model Minuteman NSS eForce
M26036QP 6402770
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 $4,200.70 $12,959.00
$4,200.70 $12,959.00
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1st Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc Company Brothers
WATERING SYSTEM, NSS, Auto-Fill Battery
Watering System, 7692481 (inclusive use within NSS Auto-Fill
eForce Burnisher Battery Ride-On) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 7692481
Manufacturer/Model $404.00
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 $404.00

V4 Better Every Day




CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS
SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 - WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

8. DAVID C. BARROW ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee Southeaster
Cleaning Cleaning & n Equipment
American 1st Associated Athens Center of Paper & Supply, The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Inc Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
IPC
Manufacturer/Model Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20 | Clarke Minuteman Windsor Clarke Minuteman
56383523 Lightning T-210 56383523 M26036QP Lightning 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 M26036QP
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
9. CHASE STREET ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
Buckeye Cherokee Southeaster
Cleaning Cleaning & n Equipment
American 15t Associated Athens Center of Paper & Supply, The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Inc Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20 | Clarke Minuteman | Windsor Clarke
56383523 Lightning T-210 56383523 M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 | Clarke 56383523
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00

V4 Better Every Day




10. JUDIA JACKSON HARRIS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee Southeaster
Cleaning Cleaning & n Equipment
American 1st Associated Athens Center of Paper & Supply, The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Inc Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20 | Clarke Minuteman Windsor Clarke Minuteman
56383523 Lightning T-210 56383523 M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 | M26036QP
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
11. FOWLER DRIVE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
Buckeye Cherokee Southeaster
Cleaning Cleaning & n Equipment
American 15t Associated Athens Center of Paper & Supply, The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Inc. Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20T | Clarke Minuteman | Windsor Clarke
56383523 Lightning -210 56383523 M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 | Clarke 56383523
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00

V4 Better Every Day




12. BARNETT SHOALS ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION
CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1%t Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20T | Clarke Minuteman Windsor Clarke Clarke Ultra Minuteman
Manufacturer/Model 56383523 Lightning -210 56383523 M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 20 M26036QP
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1st Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
HIGH SPEED BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed Pro
1500 Burnisher, Clarke 1500 (or Equal)
Hawk
Windsor BPD | SSS/Cheetah HP1520- Karcher BDP Clarke Pro
Manufacturer/Model Clarke1500 51/1500 1500 Clarke 1500 | HSB 15/1500 Clarke 1500 | 1500 US Viper VN1500
$761.25 $991.72 $799.85 $631.04 $895.68 $937..75 $779.00 $748.64 $848.00
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $761.25 $991.72 $799.85 $631.04 $895.68 $937.75 $779.00 $748.64 $848.00

V4 Better Every Day




13. GAINES ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION

CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1st Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins
Maintenance Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Thornton Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20T | Clarke Minuteman | Windsor Clarke Clarke Ultra
56383523 Lightning -210 56383523 M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 20 Clarke 56383523
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 | $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 | $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $5,299.00
14. WINTERVILLE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 15t | Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
WALK BEHIND BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed, 20
Battery Burnisher — 56383523 (or Equal)
200 Ah Wet Batteries, Onboard Battery Charger,
Passive Dust Control
Manufacturer/Model IPC
Clarke Windsor Eagle/BB20T | Clarke Minuteman | Windsor Clarke Minuteman
56383523 Lightning -210 56383523 M26036QP | Lightning 56383523 Clarke Ultra 20 | M26036QP
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY: 1 $4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 | $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00
$4,941.25 $5,865.60 $6,325.83 $5,319.66 $4,200.70 | $5,720.15 $5,240.00 $4,858.43 $4,370.00

V4 Better Every Day




15. W.R. COILE MIDDLE SCHOOL

CLARKE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
OFFICE OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTS

SUMMARY OF BID TABULATION

CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT (VARIOUS SCHOOLS), IFB# 19-1204
BID OPENING: DECEMBER 4, 2018 — WHITEHEAD ROAD ANNEX

VENDORS
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 1t | Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
HIGH SPEED BUFFER, Clarke, Ultra Speed Pro
1500 Burnisher, Clarke 1500 (or Equal)
Hawk
Manufacturer/Model Windsor BPD | SSS/Cheetah HP1520- Karcher BDP Clarke Pro
Clarke1500 51/1500 1500 Clarke 1500 | HSB 15/1500 Clarke 1500 | 1500 US Viper VN1500
. ) $761.25 $991.72 $799.85 $631.04 $895.68 $937..75 $779.00 $748.64 $848.00
Cost Per Unit / Total Cost QTY:1 | $761.25 $991.72 $799.85 $631.04 $895.68 | $937.75 $779.00 $748.64 $848.00
Buckeye Cherokee
Cleaning Cleaning & Southeastern
American 15t | Associated Athens Center of Paper Equipment & | The Haskins Thornton
Maintenance | Paper Janitorial ATL Supply KAMCO Supply, Inc. Company Brothers
10-14 DAYS
DELIVERY OF EQUIPMENT (SOME ITEMS 15 DAYS OR
(NUMBER OF CALENDAR DAYS) 3-5 DAYS 10-15 DAYS | 60 DAYS 10 DAYS 18 DAYS IN STOCK) LESS 30 DAYS 15-30 DAYS

VZ Better Every Day




